

FABCV SIMULTANEOUS PAIRS 2016 - SESSION 3 OF 3
 Eastern Contract Bridge Centre (Club No: 3-338)
 M20160418E - Monday 18/04/2016 (4½ Table Howell)
 Total Points Awarded: 1.42 Green

Rank	Pair	Names	%	MP/Max	MPs
1	9	Oliver Goodman & David Hill	57.64	83/144	.30
2	4	Liz Wilby & Eileen Lockey	53.47	77/144	.21
3	5	John Shortridge & Barbara Warrington	52.78	76/144	.15
4=	6	Neville Cook & David McKenzie	52.08	75/144	.05
4=	8	Christine Paine & Martin Murphy	52.08	75/144	.05
6	1	Chris Raisin & Helen Prohasky	50.69	73/144	
7	2	John Sinfield & Pauline Lipson	47.92	69/144	
8	7	Patricia Cox & Marilyn Hunter	45.14	65/144	
9	3	Neil Dommers & John Peyton	38.19	55/144	

Hand 1 : (Jack) 5DE makes 10				Hand 2 : (Jack) 4HN makes 10			
North(Dlr15)				North(V15)			
S: QT72	C4	1C 4D 4S 5D	9	P 1S P 2H	C6	S: 63	H: AK932
H: AK9	300	X AP		P 3H P 4H	650	D: AQ7	C: Q32
D: Q	T	-----		AP	=T		
C: KJ963		1 9 5DE 9		-----			
West(9)		East(7)		West(2)		East(Dlr10)	
S: K85	S: 9	SA	1C 4D P 5D	E S W N	S: JT72	S: K4	
H: J643	H: 852	100	AP	P 1S P 2H	H: 84	H: T76	
D: JT6	D: AK875432	M+	-----	X 3H P 4H	D: J84	D: KT52	
C: AT7	C: 2		8 5 5DE 10	AP	H6	C: 9754	C: KJ86
South(9)				South(V13)			
S: AJ643	C4	1C*4D P 5D	9	5 8 4HN 11	B	S: AQ985	
H: QT7	50	AP		E S W N		H: QJ5	
D: 9	M-	-----		P 1S P 2H		D: 963	
C: Q854		7 2 5SS 9		P 3H P 4H	H6	C: AT	
South(Dlr19)				South(V14)			
S: AK764	C4	X 3C P P	9	P X P 2H	S8	S: A742	
H: AK5	-100	X P 3S AP		AP	140	H: KQ65	
D: AJ6	=T	-----		-----	M+	D: A	
C: 82		7 2 3CE 10		3 8 2NN 9		C: J953	
South(V14)				South(V14)			
S: AK764	C4	X 3C P P	9	P X P 2H	S8	S: A742	
H: AK5	-100	X P 3S AP		AP	140	H: KQ65	
D: AJ6	=T	-----		-----	M+	D: A	
C: 82		7 2 3CE 10		3 8 2NN 9		C: J953	
South(Dlr19)				South(V14)			
S: AK764	C4	X 3C P P	9	P X P 2H	S8	S: A742	
H: AK5	-100	X P 3S AP		AP	140	H: KQ65	
D: AJ6	=T	-----		-----	M+	D: A	
C: 82		7 2 3CE 10		3 8 2NN 9		C: J953	

Hand 3 : (Jack) 3CE makes 10				Hand 4 : (Jack) 3NTN makes 9			
North(1)				North(V11)			
S: 832	SK	1S P P 2C	9	P P 1S X	DQ	S: QJ9	H: 82
H: T7643	-110	2S P P 3C		P 3C P 5C	-100	D: KT52	C: KQT7
D: T87	M	AP		AP	B		
C: J5		-----		-----			
West(V5)		East(V15)		West(VDlr4)		East(V11)	
S: Q	S: JT95	1 9 3SS 7		1 2 3CN 9	S: 8	S: KT653	
H: J982	H: Q	S W N E		W N E S	H: AT973	H: J4	
D: Q9432	D: K5	1S P P 2C		P P 1S X	D: 9843	D: QJ76	
C: 764	C: AKQT93	X P 2S 3C		P 2C 2D 3C	C: 842	C: A6	
South(Dlr19)				South(V14)			
S: AK764	C4	X 3C P P	9	P X P 2H	S8	S: A742	
H: AK5	-100	X P 3S AP		AP	140	H: KQ65	
D: AJ6	=T	-----		-----	M+	D: A	
C: 82		7 2 3CE 10		3 8 2NN 9		C: J953	
South(V14)				South(V14)			
S: AK764	C4	X 3C P P	9	P X P 2H	S8	S: A742	
H: AK5	-100	X P 3S AP		AP	140	H: KQ65	
D: AJ6	=T	-----		-----	M+	D: A	
C: 82		7 2 3CE 10		3 8 2NN 9		C: J953	
South(Dlr19)				South(V14)			
S: AK764	C4	X 3C P P	9	P X P 2H	S8	S: A742	
H: AK5	-100	X P 3S AP		AP	140	H: KQ65	
D: AJ6	=T	-----		-----	M+	D: A	
C: 82		7 2 3CE 10		3 8 2NN 9		C: J953	

Hand 5 : (Jack) 2SN makes 7 North(VDlr12) S: AJ53 H: 753 D: J987 C: AQ	7 5 2HS 7 N E S W 1D P 1H P 1S 2C 2D P 2H AP	5 7 1NE 5 E S W N P P 1C P 1D P 1S P 1N AP	Hand 6 : (Jack) No Bid makes North(10) S: QJ8 H: JT64 D: 7 C: AQT84
West(10) S: 987 H: QJT8 D: AQT32 C: J	East(8) S: KQ2 H: 92 D: 6 C: K987532	2 1 1NS 6 N E S W 1D P 1N AP 9 6 3DN 8 N E S W 1D 3C 3D AP 8 3 2NS 6 N E S W 1C*2C 2N AP	West(V12) S: A953 H: A82 D: 965 C: KJ2
South(V10) S: T64 H: AK64 D: K54 C: T64	SK -100 =T CJ -200 B	6 9 1NE 4 E S W N P P 1C P 1D P 1S P 3 8 PassIn E S W N AP	East(VDlr8) S: T2 H: K75 D: KQ843 C: 973
			South(10) S: K764 H: Q93 D: AJT2 C: 65

Hand 7 : (Jack) 5DS makes 9 North(V12) S: T H: KQJT9 D: KQJ95 C: T4	8 6 3DXS 9 S W N E P 1C 2N*P 3D X AP	6 8 3NS 6 W N E S P P 1C 1N P 2H*P 2S* P 2N P 3N	Hand 8 : (Jack) 3NTS makes 7 North(8) S: QJT42 H: Q65 D: J63 C: Q3
West(V17) S: AK54 H: A86 D: 4 C: KQJ62	East(V6) S: Q932 H: 5432 D: T3 C: A75	3 2 3DS 9 S W N E P 1C P P 1D 1S 2D 2S P P 3D AP	West(Dlr4) S: A7 H: 943 D: T8542 C: 762
South(VDlr5) S: J876 H: 7 D: A8762 C: 983	CK 670 T M+	1 7 4DN 9 S W N E P 1C 1H X P 2S 3D P P 3S P P 4D AP	East(11) S: K63 H: T87 D: A9 C: KJT94
	H7 -620 B	9 4 4SE 10 S W N E P 1C 1H 1S P 3S 4D P P 4S AP	South(17) S: 985 H: AKJ2 D: KQ7 C: A85
		4 9 4SN 10 W N E S P P 1C 1N P 3S P 4S AP	West(V17) S: AK54 H: A86 D: 4 C: KQJ62

Hand 9 : (Jack) 3HN makes 10 North(Dlr20) S: J3 H: AKQ9632 D: AK C: K7	8 6 4HN 10 N E S W 2C*P 2D*P 2H P 2S P 4H AP	7 9 4SS 12 E S W N P 1S 2H 3H P 4S AP	Hand 10: (Jack) 5SS makes 12 North(V11) S: J62 H: 653 D: KJ73 C: AQ6
West(V12) S: KQ97 H: 8 D: QJ63 C: A854	East(V4) S: 6 H: JT74 D: 95 C: QJ9632	3 4 4SS 11 E S W N P 1S P 2N P 4S AP	West(V8) S: A3 H: KJT982 D: 982 C: 97
South(4) S: AT8542 H: 5 D: T8742 C: T	S6 420 =T B S6 -100 M	8 2 2SS 11 E S W N P 1S P 2S AP	East(VDlr7) S: T8 H: AQ4 D: 54 C: JT8542
	S6 420 =T	5 1 5SS 11 E S W N P 1S P 2S P 4S P 4N P 5D P 5S AP	South(V14) S: KQ9754 H: 7 D: AQT6 C: K3

! Hand 9: 3-2: Opening Lead out of turn accepted. Law 54B
Opening lead of S6 out of turn by East accepted by South
(Original Declarer) who then opted to become dummy,
thereby appointing North as Declarer. Play then continued
in normal rotation with second card played from the hand of
South (designated dummy). No penalty.
Since the director was not called as required under Law
9B1(a) it is probable this lead out of turn was not noticed by
the players.

Hand 11: (Jack) 4SW makes 9 North(12) S: J H: AQ94 D: AJT954 C: 54	9 7 2SW 8 S W N E P 1S X P 1N 2S AP ----- 4 3 4SW 9 S W N E P 1S 2D 2S P 4S AP ----- 2 8 3SW 9 S W N E P 1S 2D P P 2S 3D P P 3S AP ----- 1 5 3DN 8 S W N E P 1S 2D P P 2S 3D AP ----- HJ -50 M+	7 9 4CXS 8 W N E S P P 1N 2C P P X P 2D 2H P 3C 3D P P 4C P P X AP ----- 3 4 2CS 9 W N E S P P 1N 2C AP ----- 8 2 1NE 11 W N E S P P 1N AP ----- 5 1 3CS 8 W N E S P P 1N 2C 2N P P 3C AP ----- S6 -100 M+	Hand 12: (Jack) 3CS makes 8 North(V7) S: J2 H: AJT63 D: JT9 C: 873	West(Dlr7) S: KT96 H: 82 D: A7652 C: 94	East(16) S: Q84 H: KQ95 D: KQ84 C: AT	South(V10) S: A753 H: 74 D: 3 C: KQJ652
---	--	---	---	---	---	---

Hand 13: (Jack) 4SE makes 7 North(VDlr10) S: T65 H: KT82 D: K74 C: KJ2	1 8 5DS 10 N E S W P 2S 3D 3S 4D P 5D AP ----- 5 4 3HW 7 N E S W P P 1D 1H 1N 2H 3D 3H AP ----- 3 9 4DS 11 N E S W P 2S X P 3H P 4D AP ----- 2 6 4DS 10 N E S W P 2S 3D 3S P P 4D AP ----- SA 130 M-	8 1 4HN 10 E S W N 1S P 2S X P 3D P 3H P 4H AP ----- 4 5 3SXE 8 E S W N 1S P 3S X AP ----- 9 3 5HN 10 E S W N 1S P 2S 3H P 4H 4S 5H AP ----- 6 2 5HN 11 E S W N 1S P 4S 5H AP ----- SK 420 M+	Hand 14: (Jack) 4HN makes 11 North(17) S: 2 H: KQJ95 D: AT3 C: AK82	West(2) S: JT843 H: 7 D: J762 C: 543	East(Dlr12) S: KQ976 H: A83 D: 84 C: QJT	South(9) S: A5 H: T642 D: KQ95 C: 976
---	---	---	--	--	--	---

Hand 15: (Jack) 2SW makes 9 North(V11) S: 62 H: QJ43 D: A54 C: AT32	1 8 3SW 9 S W N E P 1S X 2S 3H P P 3S AP ----- 5 4 3SW 9 S W N E P 1S X 2S 3H 3S AP ----- 3 9 2SW 9 S W N E P 1S P 2S AP ----- 2 6 2SW 9 S W N E P 1S X 2S AP ----- HQ -140 =T	7 3 2DS 7 W N E S 1H P 1S 2D AP ----- 9 2 2SE 6 W N E S 1H P 1S P 2S AP ----- 5 6 2NW 6 W N E S 1H P 1S P 2C P 2D P 2N AP ----- 1 4 2SE 7 W N E S 1H P 1S 2D 2S AP ----- S2 -50 B	Hand 16: (Jack) 2SE makes 7 North(9) S: QT86 H: K96 D: A9 C: T762	West(VDlr13) S: K32 H: AQJ52 D: 84 C: K95	East(V8) S: A954 H: 74 D: JT73 C: QJ4	South(10) S: J7 H: T83 D: KQ652 C: A83
--	---	--	--	---	---	--

Hand 17: (Jack) 4DS makes 9 North(Dlr7) S: 84 H: Q54 D: K873 C: Q532	3 7 2HW 8 N E S W P P P 1H P 2H AP ----- 2 9 2SW 8 N E S W P P 1D 1S P 2S AP ----- 6 5 3HW 7 N E S W P P 1D 1H 2D 2H 3D 3H AP ----- 4 1 4HW 7 N E S W P P 1D 1H 1N 3H P 4H AP ----- T	7 3 3DS 10 E S W N 1C P P X P 1D P 3D AP ----- 9 2 4DN 9 E S W N 1C P P 1D P 2D P 4C P 4D AP ----- 5 6 3DS 10 E S W N 1C P P X P 1D P 2D P 3D AP ----- 1 4 4DN 10 E S W N P P P 1D X 1S P 2D 3C 3D 4C 4D AP ----- =T	Hand 18: (Jack) 3DS makes 10 North(V18) S: AJ H: KQ85 D: AJT43 C: QJ	West(14) S: QJ2 H: AKJ32 D: QJ C: T76	East(8) S: AT53 H: 9876 D: 65 C: A94	West(4) S: 953 H: J64 D: K8 C: 96532	East(Dlr11) S: T872 H: AT92 D: 2 C: AKT4	South(11) S: K976 H: T D: AT942 C: KJ8	South(V7) S: KQ64 H: 73 D: Q9765 C: 87
---	---	---	---	---	--	--	--	--	--

Hand 19: (Jack) 3DN makes 10 North(14) S: QT95 H: 32 D: KQJ85 C: AQ	5 2 3HE 7 S W N E P P 1D 1H 2D 2H 3D 3H AP ----- 4 8 2DN 10 S W N E P P 1D X 2D AP ----- 3 1 3DN 10 S W N E P P 1D X P 1H 1S P 2D P P 2H 3D AP ----- 7 6 3DN 9 S W N E P P 1D X 3D AP ----- B	2 5 4SN 11 W N E S P 1S P 4S AP ----- 8 4 4SN 10 W N E S 1D*1S 1N 3S P 4S AP ----- 1 3 2SN 10 W N E S 1D X P 1H P 1S P 2S AP ----- 6 7 3SN 11 W N E S 1D 1S P 3S AP ----- M-	Hand 20: (Jack) 4SN makes 10 North(V11) S: KT852 H: 42 D: KJT75 C: A	West(V5) S: 876 H: A9864 D: 96 C: J93	East(V12) S: KJ43 H: KQ75 D: 32 C: KT8	West(VDlr11) S: 3 H: AK6 D: A9832 C: T985	East(V6) S: 964 H: JT8 D: Q4 C: QJ642	South(Dlr9) S: A2 H: JT D: AT74 C: 76542	South(V12) S: AQJ7 H: Q9753 D: 6 C: K73
--	--	---	---	---	--	---	---	--	---

Hand 21: (Jack) 2HS makes 7 North(VDlr8) S: AQ52 H: 32 D: J6 C: J8642	5 2 2DW 10 N E S W P P P 1D P 1H P 2D AP ----- 4 8 3CE 9 N E S W P P 2H X P 3C AP ----- 3 1 3DW 10 N E S W P P 1H X 1S X 2S 3D AP ----- 7 6 3DW 10 N E S W P P 2D*X 2H*P P 3D AP ----- =B	3 6 2HE 11 E S W N 1H P 2H AP ----- 9 5 5HE 10 E S W N 1H P 3S*P 4N P 5C P 5H AP ----- 2 4 4HE 11 E S W N 2H*P 3H P 4C P 4D P 4H AP ----- 7 8 5HE 12 E S W N 2C P 3D P 3H P 4H P 4N P 5C P 5H AP ----- B	Hand 22: (Jack) 5HE makes 11 North(5) S: T9432 H: T D: T86 C: AJ72	West(15) S: T984 H: A D: AK752 C: A75	East(9) S: K6 H: JT85 D: T83 C: KQ93	West(V9) S: 5 H: QJ53 D: QJ9543 C: K8	East(VDlr19) S: AQ87 H: AK862 D: A C: Q93	South(V8) S: J73 H: KQ9764 D: Q94 C: T	South(7) S: KJ6 H: 974 D: K72 C: T654
--	--	---	---	---	--	---	---	--	---

Hand 23: (Jack) No Bid makes
 North(V11)
 S: J872
 H: J93
 D: AT4
 C: KQ8

West(V9)
 S: QT5
 H: QT8
 D: KQ65
 C: 762

East(V9)
 S: A63
 H: A72
 D: 972
 C: J954

South(VDlr11)
 S: K94
 H: K654
 D: J83
 C: AT3

6	3	PassIn	3	6	3NS	11	
S	W	N	E	W	N	E	S
AP				P	1C	P	1H
=B				P	1S	P	3N
5	9	2DW	7	AP			
S	W	N	E				
P	P	P	1C	9	5	2NN	9
X	1D	1S	2D	W	N	E	S
AP				P	1C	X	1H
T				P	1N	P	2N
4	2	PassIn	AP				
S	W	N	E				
AP				2	4	3NN	9
=B				W	N	E	S
8	7	PassIn	P	1C	1S	X	
S	W	N	E	P	1N	P	3N
AP				AP			
=B							
7	8	3NS	12				
W	N	E	S				
P	1C*	P	1H				
P	1S	P	3N				
AP							

Hand 24: (Jack) 3NTN makes 11
 North(14)
 S: Q982
 H: Q3
 D: KJ6
 C: AQ76

West(Dlr3)
 S: 54
 H: T986
 D: 98752
 C: KT

East(10)
 S: AJ63
 H: K42
 D: Q43
 C: 854

South(13)
 S: KT7
 H: AJ75
 D: AT
 C: J932

Hand 25: (Jack) 3NTW makes 11
 North(Dlr13)
 S: K62
 H: J9
 D: AQ
 C: QJ8732

West(V12)
 S: A943
 H: 87
 D: KJ972
 C: A4

East(V14)
 S: Q87
 H: AKQ432
 D: T
 C: KT9

South(1)
 S: JT5
 H: T65
 D: 86543
 C: 65

9	8	4HE	11	8	9	4CW	9
N	E	S	W	E	S	W	N
1C	1H	P	1S	1H	P	2C	3S
2C	2H	P	3H	4C!AP			
P	4H	AP					
=B				4	7	4HE	9
7	4	4HE	11	E	S	W	N
N	E	S	W	1H	P	2N*3S	
1C	1H	P	2D	4H	AP		
P	2H	P	3H				
P	4H	AP		1	6	4HE	10
=B				E	S	W	N
6	1	3NW	10	1H	P	3H	3S
N	E	S	W	4H	AP		
1C	1H	P	2D				
P	3H	P	3N	3	5	4HE	10
AP				E	S	W	N
=B				1H	P	4H	AP
5	3	2NW	11				
N	E	S	W				
1C	X	P	1D				
P	1H	P	1N				
P	2H	P	2N				
AP							
=B							

Hand 26: (Jack) 4HE makes 10
 North(V8)
 S: KJ86532
 H:
 D: QT93
 C: Q4

West(V12)
 S: A9
 H: KJ73
 D: K75
 C: JT32

East(VDlr14)
 S: 74
 H: AQ642
 D: A84
 C: A65

South(V6)
 S: QT
 H: T985
 D: J62
 C: K987

! Hand 26: 8-9 Laws 27B, 27C1,27D1
 Insufficient bid of 3C by East over 3S by North not accepted by South. Since E/W play 4C as "Ace Ask", East was unable (as required by Law 27C1) to replace the insufficient bid with another at the lowest level which conveyed the same meaning as the 3C bid. West was therefore precluded (under Law 27D1) from making any bid other than "Pass" for the rest of the auction. East replaced the insufficient bid with "4C". Since West (offending side) became declarer there were no opening lead restrictions.

Hand 27: (Jack) 5CS makes 11
 North(10)
 S: T542
 H: KQ2
 D: QJ74
 C: Q6

West(7)
 S: AQ63
 H: JT9654
 D: 62
 C: T

East(12)
 S: KJ987
 H: 87
 D: A3
 C: A942

South(Dlr11)
 S:
 H: A3
 D: KT985
 C: KJ8753

9	8	5DXS	11				
S	W	N	E				
1C	1H	X	1S				
2D	2S	3D	3S				
5D	P	P	X				
AP							
SA							
650							
T							
7	4	5DXN	10				
S	W	N	E				
1C	P	1D	1S				
5D	P	P	X				
AP							
CA							
-100							
B							
6	1	2CS	10				
S	W	N	E				
1C	1H	1S	1N				
2C	AP						
D6							
130							
M-							
5	3	3CS	11				
S	W	N	E				
1C	1H	2N	P				
3C	AP						
HJ							
150							
M+							

Hand 28: (Jack) 3NTN makes 11
 North(14)
 S: Q982
 H: Q3
 D: KJ6
 C: AQ76

West(Dlr3)
 S: 54
 H: T986
 D: 98752
 C: KT

East(10)
 S: AJ63
 H: K42
 D: Q43
 C: 854

South(13)
 S: KT7
 H: AJ75
 D: AT
 C: J932

Hand No. 1

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
6	4	5D	X	E	9	4C	300	
1	9	5D		E	9	AS	100	
8	5	5D		E	10	4C	50	
7	2	5S		S	9	JD		100

Hand No. 2

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
6	4	4H		N	11	6C	650	
1	9	4H		N	9	6H		100
8	5	4H		N	11	6H	650	
7	2	4H		N	10	8C	620	

Hand No. 3

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
6	4	3C		E	9	KS		110
1	9	3S		S	7	7C		100
8	5	3S		S	7	4C		100
7	2	3C		E	10	KH		130

Hand No. 4

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
7	5	5C		N	10	QD		100
2	1	3C		N	9	6D	110	
9	6	2H		S	9	8S	140	
8	3	2NT		N	9	5S	150	

Hand No. 5

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
7	5	2H		S	7	JC		100
2	1	1NT		S	6	QH		100
9	6	3D		N	8	KS		100
8	3	2NT		S	6	JC		200

Hand No. 6

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
7	5	1NT		E	5	3H	200	
2	1	2D		W	7	JH	100	
9	6	1NT		E	4	4S	300	
8	3	No Bid						

Hand No. 7

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
8	6	3D	X	S	9	KC	670	
3	2	3D		S	9	KC	110	
1	7	4D		N	9	2S		100
9	4	4S		E	10	7H		620

Hand No. 8

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
8	6	3NT		S	6	7C		150
3	2	2S		N	9	AD	140	
1	7	2NT		S	7	6C		50
9	4	4S		N	10	AD	420	

Hand No. 9

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
8	6	4H		N	10	6S	420	
3	2	6H		N	10	6S		100
1	7	4H		N	9	6S		50
9	4	4H		N	10	6S	420	

Hand No. 10

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
9	7	4S		S	12	9C	680	
4	3	4S		S	11	JH	650	
2	8	2S		S	11	9C	200	
1	5	5S		S	11	9H	650	

Hand No. 11

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
9	7	2S		W	8	5C		110
4	3	4S		W	9	AD	50	
2	8	3S		W	9	AD		140
1	5	3D		N	8	JH		50

Hand No. 12

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
9	7	4C	X	S	8	8H		500
4	3	2C		S	9	AD	110	
2	8	1NT		E	11	6C		210
1	5	3C		S	8	6S		100

Hand No. 13

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
1	8	5D		S	10	AS		100
5	4	3H		W	7	4D	200	
3	9	4D		S	11	AS	150	
2	6	4D		S	10	AS	130	

Hand No. 14

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
1	8	4H		N	10	KS	420	
5	4	3S	X	E	8	QD	100	
3	9	5H		N	10	KS		50
2	6	5H		N	11	KS	450	

Hand No. 15

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
1	8	3S		W	9	QH		140
5	4	3S		W	9	QH		140
3	9	2S		W	9	3H		140
2	6	2S		W	9	AD		140

Hand No. 16

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
3	7	2D		S	7	2S		50
2	9	2S		E	6	6D	200	
6	5	2NT		W	6	6S	200	
4	1	2S		E	7	KD	100	

Hand No. 17

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
3	7	2H		W	8	8S		110
2	9	2S		W	8	3D		110
6	5	3H		W	7	3D	100	
4	1	4H		W	7	KD	150	

Hand No. 18

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
3	7	3D		S	10	9C	130	
2	9	4D		N	9	KC		100
6	5	3D		S	10	2C	130	
4	1	4D		N	10	KC	130	

Hand No. 19

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
5	2	3H		E	7	AD	200	
4	8	2D		N	10	KH	130	
3	1	3D		N	10	KH	130	
7	6	3D		N	9	KH	110	

Hand No. 20

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
5	2	4S		N	11	4C	650	
4	8	4S		N	10	QD	620	
3	1	2S		N	10	QD	170	
7	6	3S		N	11	QD	200	

Hand No. 21

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
5	2	2D		W	10	3H		130
4	8	3C		E	9	KH		110
3	1	3D		W	10	3H		130
7	6	3D		W	10	3H		130

Hand No. 22

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
6	3	2H		E	11	6C		200
5	9	5H		E	10	2D	100	
4	2	4H		E	11	10C		650
8	7	5H		E	12	6S		680

Hand No. 23

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
6	3	No Bid						
5	9	2D		W	7	2S	100	
4	2	No Bid						
8	7	No Bid						

Hand No. 24

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
6	3	3NT		S	11	5S	460	
5	9	2NT		N	9	3S	150	
4	2	3NT		N	9	4D	400	
8	7	3NT		S	12	9D	490	

Hand No. 25

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
9	8	4H		E	11	6C		650
7	4	4H		E	11	10S		650
6	1	3NT		W	10	7C		630
5	3	2NT		W	11	7C		210

Hand No. 26

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
9	8	4C		W	9	6S	100	
7	4	4H		E	9	QS	100	
6	1	4H		E	10	QS		620
5	3	4H		E	10	10S		620

Hand No. 27

NS PAIR NUMBER	EW PAIR NUMBER	CONTRACT	DBL	DECL	TRICKS MADE	LEAD	N/S SCORE	E/W SCORE
9	8	5D	X	S	11	AS	550	
7	4	5D	X	N	10	AC		100
6	1	2C		S	10	6D	130	
5	3	3C		S	11	JH	150	

```

=====
Hand: 1 5D(East) making 10      N E S W      E S W N      Hand: 2 4H(North) making 10
      North(Dlr15)                1C 5D P P    P 1S P 2H    North(V15)
      S: QT72                      P            P 2S P 3N    S: 63
      H: AK9                        -----      P 4H P P     H: AK932
      D: Q                          S W N E      P            D: AQ7
      C: KJ963                      C4 CA*C9 C2  -----      C: Q32
West(9)                            East(7)      D9 D6 DQ DA*  E S W N      West(2)                            East(Dlr10)
S: K85                            S: 9         H7 HJ HK*H2  CK CA*C4 C3  S: JT72                            S: K4
H: J643                          H: 852       HT H3 HA*H5  H6 HJ*H8 H3  H: 84                              H: T76
D: JT6                            D: AK875432 SA*S5 S2 S9  H7 HQ*H4 H9  D: J84                              D: KT52
C: AT7                            C: 2         C5 C7 CK D7* C6 CT C5 CQ*  C: 9754                            C: KJ86
      South(9)                    S3 DT*C3 D2  S4 SA*S7 S3  South(V13)
      S: AJ643                    S4 SK*S7 H8  D5 D3 D4 DA*  S: AQ985
      H: QT7                      HQ H4 H9 D3* C8 H5*C7 C2  H: QJ5
      D: 9                        S6 DJ*C6 D4  DK*D6 D8 DQ  D: 963
      C: Q854                    C8 H6 ST D5* SK*S5 S2 S6  C: AT
      SJ S8 CJ DK*              DT D9 DJ*D7  DT D9 DJ*D7  DT D9 DJ*D7
      CQ CT SQ D8*              D2 S8 SJ HK* D2 S8 SJ HK*
      HT S9 C9 HA*              HT S9 C9 HA*
      CJ SQ ST H2*              CJ SQ ST H2*
=====

```

```

=====
Hand: 3 3C(East) making 10      S W N E      W N E S      Hand: 4 3NT(North) making 9
      North(1)                    1S P P 3C    P P 1S P     North(V11)
      S: 832                      P P P        P 1N P 2S    S: QJ9
      H: T7643                    -----      P 3N P P     H: 82
      D: T87                      S W N E      P            D: KT52
      C: J5                        SA*SQ S2 S5  -----      C: KQT7
West(V5)                            East(V15)    HA*H2 H3 HQ  E S W N      West(VDlr4)                            East(V11)
S: Q                              S: JT95      SK C4*S3 S9  D6 DA*D3 D5  S: 8                              S: KT653
H: J982                          H: Q         C2 C6 C5 CQ* CA*C3 C2 CQ  H: AT973                            H: J4
D: Q9432                         D: K5        C8 C7 CJ CK* DQ*S2 D9 D2  D: 9843                            D: QJ76
C: 764                            C: AKQT93   S4 D2 H4 C3* DJ C5 D8 DK*  C: 842                              C: A6
      South(Dlr19)                S6 D3 D7 C9* S3 S4 S8 SJ*  South(V14)
      S: AK764                    S7 D4 S8 SJ* H4 HQ HA*H2  S: A742
      H: AK5                      D6 H8 H6 ST* D7 H5 D4 DT*  H: KQ65
      D: AJ6                      DJ DQ*D8 D5  C6 C9*C4 C7  D: A
      C: 82                      DA*D9 DT DK  S5 CJ C8 CK*  C: J953
      HK H9 H7 CT*              S6 H6 H3 CT*
      H5 HJ HT CA*              HJ HK*H7 H8
      ST SA*H9 S9
      SK*S7 HT SQ
=====

```

```

=====
Hand: 5 2S(North) making 7      N E S W      E S W N      Hand: 6 ** Passed In **
      North(VDlr12)                1D 2C X P    P P P P     North(10)
      S: AJ53                      2S P P P    S: QJ8
      H: 753                        -----      H: JT64
      D: J987                      E S W N      D: 7
      C: AQ                          C7 C4 CJ CQ* C: AQT84
West(10)                            East(8)      D6 DK DA*D7  West(V12)                            East(VDlr8)
S: 987                            S: KQ2      H2 HK*HQ H3  S: A953                            S: T2
H: QJT8                          H: 92       S2*D4 D3 D8  H: A82                              H: K75
D: AQT32                         D: 6        C3 C6 S8*CA  D: 965                              D: KQ843
C: J                              C: K987532  C9 D5 DQ*D9  C: KJ2                              C: 973
      South(V10)                    SQ*H4 DT DJ  South(10)
      S: T64                      H9 HA*H8 H5  S: K764
      H: AK64                    SK S4 S7 SA* H: Q93
      D: K54                      C2 ST*S9 S3  D: AJT2
      C: T64                      C5 H6 HT*H7  C: 65
      C8 S6*D2 S5
      CK CT HJ SJ*
=====

```

Hand: 7	5D(South) making 9	S	W	N	E	W	N	E	S	Hand: 8	3NT(South) making 7
	North(V12)	P	1C	2N	P	P	P	P	1N		North(8)
	S: T	3D	3S	P	4S	P	2H	P	2S		S: QJT42
	H: KQJT9	5D	P	P	P	P	2N	P	3N		D: Q65
	D: KQJ95	-----				P	P	P			D: J63
	C: T4	W	N	E	S	-----					C: Q3
	West(V17)	CK*C4	C7	C3	W	N	E	S		West(Dlr4)	East(11)
S: AK54	S: Q932	SA*ST	S9	S8	D4	D3	DA*DQ		S: A7	S: K63	
H: A86	H: 5432	CQ	CT	CA*C8	H3	HQ*H8	H2		H: 943	H: T87	
D: 4	D: T3	SK	D5*S2	S6	SA*S2	S3	S8		D: T8542	D: A9	
C: KQJ62	C: A75	D4	D9	D3	DA*	C6	CQ	CK*C5	C: 762	C: KJT94	
	South(VDlr5)	C2	DJ*DT	D2	C7	C3	CJ	CA*		South(17)	
	S: J876	HA*H9	H5	H7	H4	H5	HT	HJ*		S: 985	
	H: 7	CJ	DQ*C5	C9	D2	D6	D9	DK*		H: AKJ2	
	D: A8762	H6	HK	H2	D6*	H9	H6	H7	HK*	D: KQ7	
	C: 983	S4	DK*S3	S7	D5	S4	S6	HA*		C: A85	
		H8	HQ*H3	SJ	D8	DJ*C4	D7				
		S5	HJ	H4	D7*	S7	SQ	SK*S5			
		C6	HT	SQ	D8*	C2	ST	CT*C8			
						DT	SJ	C9*S9			

Hand: 9	3H(North) making 10	N	E	S	W	E	S	W	N	Hand: 10	5S(South) making 12
	North(Dlr20)	2C	P	2D	P	P	1S	3H	3S		North(V11)
	S: J3	2H	P	3C	P	4H	4S	P	P		S: J62
	H: AKQ9632	3H	P	P	P	5H	5S	P	P		H: 653
	D: AK	-----				P	-----				D: KJ73
	C: K7	E	S	W	N	-----				C: AQ6	
	West(V12)	CQ	CT	CA*C7	W	N	E	S		West(V8)	East(VDlr7)
S: KQ97	S: 6	H7	H5	H8	HK*	C9	C6	C2	CK*	S: A3	S: T8
H: 8	H: JT74	H4	D2	D6	HQ*	S3	SJ*S8	S4		H: KJT982	H: AQ4
D: QJ63	D: 95	HT	S2	C4	HA*	D2	D3	D5	DQ*	D: 982	D: 54
C: A854	C: QJ9632	C3	D4	C5	CK*	SA*S2	ST	SQ		C: 97	C: JT8542
	South(4)	D9	D7	D3	DK*	D9	D7	D4	DA*		South(V14)
	S: AT8542	D5	D8	DJ	DA*	C7	CQ*C4	C3		S: KQ9754	
	H: 5	S6	SA*S9	S3		D8	DJ*C5	D6		H: 7	
	D: T8742	C2	S4	SQ*SJ		H9	DK*C8	DT		D: AQT6	
	C: T	C6	DT	DQ	H2*	H2	CA*CT	H7		C: K3	
		HJ*S5	C8	H9		H8	H3	H4	S5*		
		CJ	S8	S7	H3*	HT	S6	CJ	SK*		
		C9	ST	SK	H6*	HJ	H5	HQ	S9*		
						HK	H6	HA	S7*		

Hand: 11	4S(West) making 9	S	W	N	E	W	N	E	S	Hand: 12	3C(South) making 8
	North(12)	P	1S	3D	P	P	P	1N	3C		North(V7)
	S: J	P	4S	P	P	P	P	P			S: J2
	H: AQ94	-----				W	N	E	S		D: AJT63
	D: AJT954	N	E	S	W	ST	SJ	SQ	SA*		D: JT9
	C: 54	C5	C3	C2	CJ*	H8	HT	HK*H4			C: 873
	West(14)	SJ	S4	S3	SK*	D7	D9	DK*D3		West(Dlr7)	East(16)
S: AKT976	S: 54	D9	S5	S8	SA*	S6	S2	S8*S3		S: KT96	S: Q84
H: 8	H: JT532	D5	H2	SQ*S6		D2	DT	D4	C5*	H: 82	H: KQ95
D: 72	D: Q63	D4	D3	DK*D2		C9	C3	CA*CJ		D: A7652	D: KQ84
C: AQJT	C: K73	DA*D6	D8	D7		D5	DJ	DQ	C2*	C: 94	C: AT
	South(Dlr8)	HA*H3	H7	H8		C4	C7	CT	CQ*		South(V10)
	S: Q832	C4	C7	C8	CQ*	H2	HA*H5	H7		S: A753	
	H: K76	DT	H5	S2	S7*	D6	H3	H9	C6*	H: 74	
	D: K8	H4	CK*C6	CT		S9	C8*S4	S5		D: 3	
	C: 9862	DJ	DQ	C9	S9*	DA	HJ	HQ	CK*	C: KQJ652	
		H9	HT	H6	ST*	SK*H6	D8	S7			
		HQ	HJ	HK	CA*						

Hand: 13	4SX(East) making 7	N E S W	E S W N	Hand: 14	4H(North) making 11
	North(VDlr10)	P 2S 3D 4S	1S P 2S X		North(17)
S:	T65	X P P P	P 3D P 3H	S:	2
H:	KT82	-----	P 4H P P	H:	KQJ95
D:	K74	S W N E	P	D:	AT3
C:	KJ2	DQ DA*D7 D2	-----	C:	AK82
West(V13)	East(V6)	S7 S9 S6 SK*	E S W N	West(2)	East(Dlr12)
S:	AJ9	C8 SJ*S5 S2	SK SA*S8 S2	S:	JT843
H:	Q9754	D3 SA*ST S3	HA*H2 H7 HJ	H:	7
D:	A5	HA*H4 H8 HJ	SQ S5 S3 H5*	D:	J762
C:	QT6	DJ D5 D4 S4*	H3 H4 C3 H9*	C:	543
	South(V11)	C4 CT CJ*C3	H8 H6 S4 HQ*		South(9)
S:	7	D6 H5 DK*C5	CT*C6 C5 C2	S:	A5
H:	A	CA*C6 C2 C9	D8 D5 DJ DA*	H:	T642
D:	QJT9863	C7 CQ CK S8*	D4 D9 D2 DT*	D:	KQ95
C:	A874	D8 H7 HT*H3	CJ C7 C4 CK*	C:	976
		D9 H9 HK*H6	CQ C9 ST CA*		
		DT HQ H2 SQ*	S6 HT*SJ C8		
			S7 DK*D6 D3		
			S9 DQ D7 HK*		

Hand: 15	2S(West) making 9	S W N E	W N E S	Hand: 16	2S(East) making 7
	North(V11)	P 1S P 2S	1H P 1S P		North(9)
S:	62	P P P	2S P P P	S:	QT86
H:	QJ43	-----	-----	H:	K96
D:	A54	N E S W	S W N E	D:	A9
C:	AT32	HQ H5 HA*H9	DK*D4 D9 DT	C:	T762
West(13)	East(6)	H4 H6 HT HK*	D5 D8 DA*D3	West(VDlr13)	East(V8)
S:	QJT93	S6 S7 SA*S3	CA*C5 C7 CQ	S:	K32
H:	K9	CA*C4 C6 CQ	H8 HJ HK*H7	H:	AQJ52
D:	J2	HJ H7 H2 S9*	C8 C9 C2 CJ*	D:	84
C:	KQJ8	S2 S4 S5 ST*	D2 H2 S6*D7	C:	K95
	South(VDlr10)	C2 C7 C9 CJ*	C3 CK*CT C4		South(10)
S:	A5	C3 D6 C5 CK*	S7 S2 S8 SA*	S:	J7
H:	AT82	D4 DK*D3 D2	SJ SK*ST S4	H:	T83
D:	QT93	DA*D7 D9 DJ	H3 HQ*H6 H4	D:	KQ652
C:	965	D5 D8 DT SJ*	HT HA H9 S5*	C:	A83
		CT S8*H8 C8	D6 S3 SQ*DJ		
		H3 SK*DQ SQ	DQ H5 C6 S9*		

Hand: 17	4D(South) making 9	N E S W	E S W N	Hand: 18	3D(South) making 10
	North(Dlr7)	P P 1D 1H	1C P 2C X		North(V18)
S:	84	1N 2H P P	3C 3D P P	S:	AJ
H:	Q54	3D 3H 4D P	P	H:	KQ85
D:	K873	P P	-----	D:	AJT43
C:	Q532	W N E S	W N E S	C:	QJ
West(14)	East(8)	HA*H4 H6 HT	C3 CJ CK*C8	West(4)	East(Dlr11)
S:	QJ2	C7 C2 CA*C8	C2 CQ CA*C7	S:	953
H:	AKJ32	CT C3 C9 CK*	DK DA*D2 D6	H:	J64
D:	QJ	DQ DK*D6 D2	D8 D3 H9 DQ*	D:	K8
C:	T76	DJ*D7 D5 D4	H4 HQ HA*H3	C:	96532
	South(11)	C6 CQ*C4 CJ	S3 SJ*S8 S6		South(V7)
S:	K976	H3 C5*S5 S6	S5 SA*S2 S4	S:	KQ64
H:	T	S2 S4 S3 SK*	H6 HK*H2 H7	H:	73
D:	AT942	SJ S8 SA*S7	HJ H5 HT D5*	D:	Q9765
C:	KJ8	SQ D3*ST S9	S9 D4*S7 SK	C:	87
		H2 H5 H7 D9*	C5 H8 C4 D7*		
		HJ D8 H8 DA*	C6 DT*ST SQ		
		HK HQ H9 DT*	C9 DJ*CT D9		

```

=====
Hand: 19 3D(North) making 10      S W N E      W N E S      Hand: 20 4S(North) making 10
      North(14)                    P P 1D X      1D 1S P 3D      North(V11)
      S: QT95                       2N P 3D P      P 4S P P        S: KT852
      H: 32                           P P            P          H: 42
      D: KQJ85                        -----          D: KJT75
      C: AQ                            E S W N      E S W N          C: A
      West(V5)                        HK*HT H9 H3   DQ D6 DA*D5     West(VDlr11)      East(V6)
      S: 876                          H5 HJ HA*H2   H8 H3 HA*H4     S: 3              S: 964
      H: A9864                        SJ SA*S7 ST   HT H5 HK*H2     H: AK6            H: JT8
      D: 96                            D3 D4 D6 DQ* C6 C3 CT CA*  D: A9832         D: Q4
      C: J93                            D2 DT*D9 D5   S6 SJ*S3 S2     C: T985           C: QJ642
      South(Dlr9)                      C8 C2 C3 CA*  S4 S7 D2 SK*    South(V12)
      S: A2                            SK*S2 S6 S9   S9 SQ*C5 S5     S: AQJ7
      H: JT                            HQ DA*H4 CQ   HJ HQ*H6 D7     H: Q9753
      D: AT74                          CT C4 C9 D8* C2 H9 D3 S8*  D: 6
      C: 76542                        S3 C5 S8 SQ* D4 C7 D8 DK*  C: K73
      CK C7 CJ DJ*                     S4 C6 H6 S5* C4 H7 D9 DJ*
      H7 D7 H8 DK*                     CJ CK C8 DT*
      CK C7 CJ DJ*                     CQ SA*C9 ST
=====

```

```

=====
Hand: 21 2HX(South) making 7      N E S W      E S W N      Hand: 22 5H(East) making 11
      North(VDlr8)                  P P 2H X      1H P 4H P      North(5)
      S: AQ52                        P P P        4N P 5C X      S: T9432
      H: 32                           -----          5H P P P      H: T
      D: J6                            W N E S      -----          D: T86
      C: J8642                        HA*H2 H5 H7   S W N E          C: AJ72
      West(15)                        ST S2 SK*S3   C4 C8 CJ CQ*   West(V9)          East(VDlr19)
      S: T984                          C7 H3 HT HK* H7 HJ*HT H2   S: 5              S: AQ87
      H: A                              S4 S5 S6 SJ* S6 S5 S2 SA*  H: QJ53           H: AK862
      D: AK752                          D2 C2 H8 HQ* D2 D3 D6 DA*  D: QJ9543        D: A
      C: A75                            S8 SQ HJ*S7   SJ H3*S3 S7    C: K8              C: Q93
      South(V8)                        DK*D6 D8 D4   D7 DJ D8 H6*   South(7)
      S: J73                            DA*DJ D3 D9   SK H5*S4 S8    S: KJ6
      H: KQ9764                        D7 C4 DT DQ* DK D4 DT HK*  H: 974
      D: Q94                            S9 C6 C3 H4* H4 HQ*S9 H8   D: K72
      C: T                              C5 C8 CQ*CT  H9*D5 C2 C3    C: T654
      CA CJ CK H6*                     C5 CK CA*C9   C6 D9 C7 HA*
      D5 SA C9 H9*                     CT DQ ST SQ*
=====

```

```

=====
Hand: 23 ** Passed In **          S W N E      W N E S      Hand: 24 3NT(North) making 11
      North(V11)                    P P P P      P 1C P 1H      North(14)
      S: J872                        P 1S P 2D     S: Q982
      H: J93                          P 3N P P      H: Q3
      D: AT4                            P              D: KJ6
      C: KQ8                            -----          C: AQ76
      West(V9)                        E S W N      West(Dlr3)      East(10)
      S: QT5                          D3 DT*D2 D6   S: 54            S: AJ63
      H: QT8                          SJ*S7 S5 S2   H: T986         H: K42
      D: KQ65                          H2 H5 H6 HQ* D: 98752     D: Q43
      C: 762                          S6 ST*S4 S8   C: KT            C: 854
      South(VDlr11)                   SA*SK D5 S9   South(13)
      S: K94                            DQ DA*D8 DJ   S: KT7
      H: K654                          C4 C9 CT CQ* H: AJ75
      D: J83                            S3 H7 H8 SQ* D: AT
      C: AT3                            D4 HJ D7 DK* C: J932
      H4 HA*H9 H3
      C5 C2 CK CA*
      C8 CJ*D9 C7
      HK C3 HT C6*
=====

```

Hand: 25 3NT(West) making 11
 North(Dlr13)
 S: K62
 H: J9
 D: AQ
 C: QJ8732

West(V12) East(V14)
 S: A943 S: Q87
 H: 87 H: AKQ432
 D: KJ972 D: T
 C: A4 C: KT9

South(1)
 S: JT5
 H: T65
 D: 86543
 C: 65

N	E	S	W	E	S	W	N
1C	1H	P	1N	1H	P	2C	3S
P	3N	P	P	P	P	4H	P
P				P	P		
N	E	S	W	S	W	N	E
CQ	C9	C5	CA*	SQ	SA*S8	S7	
SK*S7	S5	S3		H5	H3	S6	HA*
DA*DT	D3	D2		H8	HJ*S2	H2	
HJ	HQ*H5	H7		H9	H7	S3	HQ*
S2	SQ*ST	S4		C9	CT	CQ*C5	
H9	HK*H6	H8		ST	S9	SK*S4	
C2	HA*HT	C4		CK*C2	C4	C6	
C3	H4*D4	D7		HT	HK*S5	H4	
C7	H3*D5	D9		C7	C3	D3	CA*
C8	H2*D6	S9		D2	D5	D9	DA*
CJ	CK*C6	DJ		D6	DK*DT	D4	
S6	CT*D8	DK		C8	CJ*SJ	D8	
DQ	S8	SJ	SA*	DJ	D7	DQ	H6*

Hand: 26 4H(East) making 10
 North(V8)
 S: KJ86532
 H:
 D: QT93
 C: Q4

West(V12) East(VDlr14)
 S: A9 S: 74
 H: KJ73 H: AQ642
 D: K75 D: A84
 C: JT32 C: A65

South(V6)
 S: QT
 H: T985
 D: J62
 C: K987

Hand: 27 5CX(South) making 11
 North(10)
 S: T542
 H: KQ2
 D: QJ74
 C: Q6

West(7) East(12)
 S: AQ63 S: KJ987
 H: JT9654 H: 87
 D: 62 D: A3
 C: T C: A942

South(Dlr11)
 S:
 H: A3
 D: KT985
 C: KJ8753

S	W	N	E	W	N	E	S
1C	1H	X	1S	P	1D	P	2C
3C	3S	P	P	P	2N	P	3H
5C	P	P	X	P	3N	P	P
P	P	P		P			
W	N	E	S	E	S	W	N
D6	D4	DA*D5		ST	SQ	SK*S3	
D2	D7	D3	D8*	S8	S7	S4	SA*
CT	CQ	CA*C3		C9	CQ	CA*C8	
S6	S2	S7	C5*	S9	C2	SJ*S2	
H9	H2	H8	HA*	CJ*C3	C5	CT	
H6	HQ*H7	H3		C7	CK*D2	H5	
H4	C6	C2	C7*	H7	H2	H3	HQ*
H5	S4	C4	CJ*	D4	D5	S5	S6*
S3	S5	C9	CK*	H9	HK*H4	H8	
HT	DJ*S8	D9		HJ	HA*HT	D3	
HJ	HK	S9	C8*	D8	H6*D6	D7	
SQ	DQ	SJ	DK*	DJ	DT	D9	DA*
SA	ST	SK	DT*	C6	C4	DQ	DK*

Hand: 28 3NT(North) making 9
 North(V13)
 S: A632
 H: Q85
 D: AK73
 C: T8

West(Dlr10) East(3)
 S: KJ54 S: T98
 H: T43 H: J97
 D: Q962 D: J84
 C: A5 C: J976

South(V14)
 S: Q7
 H: AK62
 D: T5
 C: KQ432

Hand: 29 4H(East) making 10
 North(VDlr9)
 S: QJT75
 H: KQ4
 D: 8
 C: J983

West(V11) East(V11)
 S: AK98 S: 6
 H: 9876 H: AJT32
 D: JT9 D: A63
 C: K4 C: QT72

South(V9)
 S: 432
 H: 5
 D: KQ7542
 C: A65

N	E	S	W	E	S	W	N
P	1H	2D	3D	P	P	1C	2D
P	4H	P	P	P	3D	P	P
P				P			
S	W	N	E	E	S	W	N
DK	D9	D8	DA*	C7	C2	CJ	CK*
S2	SK*S5	S6		D8	D2	DA*DJ	
S4	SA*S7	D3		HK	HA*HJ	HQ	
H5	H6*H4	H3		D6	D5	D3	DK*
C6	H7	HQ	HA*	H4	S3	DT	DQ*
CA*C4	C9	C2		H6	S6	S5	D4*
DQ*DT	C3	D6		HT*H3	H2	H9	
S3	S8	ST	H2*	S7	S9	SA*S2	
C5	CK*C8	C7		C3	C4	C5	C6*
D2	DJ*SJ	CT		S8	SK*S4	SQ	
D4	S9	SQ	HT*	H5	H8	C8	D7*
D5	H8*CJ	CQ		H7	CT	ST	D9*
D7	H9	HK*HJ		SJ	CA*CQ	C9	

Hand: 30 3D(North) making 10
 North(13)
 S: Q2
 H: Q9
 D: KQJ974
 C: K96

West(12) East(Dlr4)
 S: AT54 S: J87
 H: J2 H: KT7654
 D: AT3 D: 86
 C: QJ85 C: 73

South(11)
 S: K963
 H: A83
 D: 52
 C: AT42

```

=====
Hand: 31  2H(South) making 10      S W N E | W N E S      Hand: 32  2NT(West) making 7
      North(V9)                    1H 1N 2H P | 1N P 2N P      North(7)
      S: KT65                       P P          | P P          S: Q8
      H: JT5                         -----      H: Q9654
      D: KQ93                        W N E S      | N E S W      D: J76
      C: T3                          SQ S5 S2 SA* | H5 H2 HK*H3  C: Q97
      West(16)                       H3 HT*H4 H2  | H4 HA*H8 H7  West(VDlr16)  East(V9)
      S: QJ9                         S: 8732      | C7 C2 C3 CA* S: AK95      S: 432
      H: A63                         H: 84        | SQ S2 S7 SK* H: JT73      H: A2
      D: AT76                        D: J54      | HQ*S3 D5 HT  D: 98        D: KQ32
      C: KQ8                         C: 6542     | CQ*CT C5 C7  H9 D2 C4 HJ* C: AKJ        C: T652
      South(VDlr14)                  DA*D3 D4 D2  | D6 DQ DA*D8  South(8)
      S: A4                          C8 S6 C6 CJ* | D7 DK*DT D9  S: JT76
      H: KQ972                       D6 D9 S3 C9* | C9 C5 C8 CK* H: K8
      D: 82                          S9 SK*S7 S4  | S8 S4 S6 SA* D: AT54
      C: AJ97                        DT DQ*D5 D8  | H6 D3 ST*S5  C: 843
      SJ ST S8 HK*                   DT DK DJ H9* | DJ C6 SJ*S9
      CQ CT D4*CJ                   SJ ST S8 HK* | CQ CT D4*CJ
=====

```

```

=====
Hand: 33  6NT(North) making 12     N E S W | E S W N      Hand: 34  3NT(East) making 9
      North(Dlr10)                  P P 2C P | 1C P 1D P      North(V5)
      S: 98                          2N P 3N P | 1S P 2H P      S: A543
      H: KQJ9                        4C P 4S P | 2N P 3N P      H: J863
      D: Q83                          6N P P P  | P P          D: 843
      C: QT76                       -----      C: T6
      West(3)                        E S W N | S W N E      West(16)      East(Dlr13)
      S: T762                        C4 C2 C8 CT* | HT H7 H3 HK* S: J6        S: K872
      H: T86                         SA*S3 S7 S8  | C2 CJ*C6 C3  H: A7        H: K4
      D: K762                        D9 DA*D7 D3  | H2 C7 CT CK* D: KJ65      D: AT
      C: 83                          C5 CA*C3 C7  | H5 C8*S5 C4  C: AQJ87     C: K9543
      South(22)                      C9 CK*D6 C6  | S9 SJ SA*S2  South(V6)
      S: KQJ3                        S5 SJ*S2 S9  | H9 HA*H6 H4  S: QT9
      H: A5                          S4 SK*S6 D8  | ST CQ*D3 C5  H: QT952
      D: AJT5                        H2 SQ*ST DQ  | D9 D5 D8 DA* D: Q972
      C: AK2                         H3 HA*H6 H9  | HQ CA*S3 C9  C: 2
      H4 H5 H8 HQ*                   SQ*S6 S4 S7  |
      CJ D5 D2 CQ*                   D2 DK*D4 DT  |
      H7 DT HT HK*                   D7*D6 H8 S8  |
      D4 DJ DK HJ*                   DQ*DJ HJ SK  |
=====

```

```

=====
Hand: 35  3NT(South) making 7      S W N E | W N E S      Hand: 36  2NT(East) making 6
      North(8)                      1N P 2C P | P 1S P P      North(V15)
      S: QJ                          2S P 3N P | X P 2N P      S: AK965
      H: 8653                        P P          | P P          H: 93
      D: AT82                        -----      D: J3
      C: J32                         W N E S      | S W N E      C: AK52
      West(V9)                       D5 D8*D3 D6  | S8 S2 SK*S4  West(VDlr8)  East(V13)
      S: T8543                       S3 SJ SK SA* | C7 C6 CA*C3  S: 32        S: QJ4
      H: A4                          S4 SQ*S2 S6  | ST S3 S6 SQ* H: QT75      H: KJ8
      D: QJ75                        HA*H3 H2 HK  | D5 DK*D3 D4  D: KT62     D: AQ94
      C: Q5                          ST*H5 C9 S7  | D8 D2 DJ DA* C: QJ6        C: 943
      South(Dlr15)                   H4 H6 H7 HQ* | C8 CJ CK*C4  South(V4)
      S: A976                       S5 D2 C7 S9* | S7 H5 SA*SJ  S: T87
      H: KQ                          D7 DT D4 DK* | H6 D6 S9*H8  H: A642
      D: K96                         DJ DA*CT D9  | H2 H7 S5*C9  D: 875
      C: K864                       C5 C2 CA*C4  | HA*HT H9 HK  C: T87
      S8 H8 HJ*C6                   CQ C3 HT*C8  | CT CQ*C5 HJ
      DQ CJ H9*CK                   H4 HQ*H3 DQ  |
=====

```

<p># 1 ♠ QT72 N/None ♥ AK9 Opt. res. -100 ♦ Q ♣ KJ963</p> <p>♠ K85 ♠ 9 ♥ J643 ♥ 852 ♦ JT6 ♦ AK875432 ♣ AT7 ♣ 2</p> <p>15 ♠ AJ643 9 ♥ QT7 7 ♦ 9 9 ♣ Q854</p>	<p># 2 ♠ 63 E/NS ♥ AK932 Opt. res. 650 ♦ AQ7 ♣ Q32</p> <p>♠ JT72 ♠ K4 ♥ 84 ♥ T76 ♦ J84 ♦ KT52 ♣ 9754 ♣ KJ86</p> <p>15 ♠ AQ985 2 ♥ QJ5 10 ♦ 963 13 ♣ AT</p>	<p># 3 ♠ 832 S/EW ♥ T7643 Opt. res. -130 ♦ T87 ♣ J5</p> <p>♠ Q ♠ JT95 ♥ J982 ♥ Q ♦ Q9432 ♦ K5 ♣ 764 ♣ AKQT93</p> <p>1 ♠ AK764 5 ♥ AK5 15 ♦ AJ6 19 ♣ 82</p>	<p># 4 ♠ QJ9 W/All ♥ 82 Opt. res. 600 ♦ KT52 ♣ KQT7</p> <p>♠ 8 ♠ KT653 ♥ AT973 ♥ J4 ♦ 9843 ♦ QJ76 ♣ 842 ♣ A6</p> <p>11 ♠ A742 4 ♥ KQ65 11 ♦ A 14 ♣ J953</p>
<p># 5 ♠ AJ53 N/NS ♥ 753 Opt. res. -90 ♦ J987 ♣ AQ</p> <p>♠ 987 ♠ KQ2 ♥ QJT8 ♥ 92 ♦ AQT32 ♦ 6 ♣ J ♣ K987532</p> <p>12 ♠ T64 10 ♥ AK64 8 ♦ K54 10 ♣ T64</p>	<p># 6 ♠ QJ8 E/EW ♥ JT64 Opt. res. 400 ♦ 7 ♣ AQT84</p> <p>♠ A953 ♠ T2 ♥ A82 ♥ K75 ♦ 965 ♦ KQ843 ♣ KJ2 ♣ 973</p> <p>10 ♠ K764 12 ♥ Q93 8 ♦ AJT2 10 ♣ 65</p>	<p># 7 ♠ T S/All ♥ KQJT9 Opt. res. -140 ♦ KQJ95 ♣ T4</p> <p>♠ AK54 ♠ Q932 ♥ A86 ♥ 5432 ♦ 4 ♦ T3 ♣ KQJ62 ♣ A75</p> <p>12 ♠ J876 17 ♥ 7 6 ♦ A8762 5 ♣ 983</p>	<p># 8 ♠ QJT42 W/None ♥ Q65 Opt. res. 140 ♦ J63 ♣ Q3</p> <p>♠ A7 ♠ K63 ♥ 943 ♥ T87 ♦ T8542 ♦ A9 ♣ 762 ♣ KJT94</p> <p>8 ♠ 985 4 ♥ AKJ2 11 ♦ KQ7 17 ♣ A85</p>
<p># 9 ♠ J3 N/EW ♥ AKQ9632 Opt. res. 420 ♦ AK ♣ K7</p> <p>♠ KQ97 ♠ 6 ♥ 8 ♥ JT74 ♦ QJ63 ♦ 95 ♣ A854 ♣ QJ9632</p> <p>20 ♠ AT8542 12 ♥ 5 4 ♦ T8742 4 ♣ T</p>	<p># 10 ♠ J62 E/All ♥ 653 Opt. res. 650 ♦ KJ73 ♣ AQ6</p> <p>♠ A3 ♠ T8 ♥ KJT982 ♥ AQ4 ♦ 982 ♦ 54 ♣ 97 ♣ JT8542</p> <p>11 ♠ KQ9754 8 ♥ 7 7 ♦ AQT6 14 ♣ K3</p>	<p># 11 ♠ J S/None ♥ AQ94 Opt. res. -140 ♦ AJT954 ♣ 54</p> <p>♠ AKT976 ♠ 54 ♥ 8 ♥ JT532 ♦ 72 ♦ Q63 ♣ AQJT ♣ K73</p> <p>12 ♠ Q832 14 ♥ K76 6 ♦ K8 8 ♣ 9862</p>	<p># 12 ♠ J2 W/NS ♥ AJT63 Opt. res. -140 ♦ JT9 ♣ 873</p> <p>♠ KT96 ♠ Q84 ♥ 82 ♥ KQ95 ♦ A7652 ♦ KQ84 ♣ 94 ♣ AT</p> <p>7 ♠ A753 7 ♥ 74 16 ♦ 3 10 ♣ KQJ652</p>
<p># 13 ♠ T65 N/All ♥ KT82 Opt. res. 600 ♦ K74 ♣ KJ2</p> <p>♠ AJ9 ♠ KQ8432 ♥ Q9754 ♥ J63 ♦ A5 ♦ 2 ♣ QT6 ♣ 953</p> <p>10 ♠ 7 13 ♥ A 6 ♦ QJT9863 11 ♣ A874</p>	<p># 14 ♠ 2 E/None ♥ KQJ95 Opt. res. 450 ♦ AT3 ♣ AK82</p> <p>♠ JT843 ♠ KQ976 ♥ 7 ♥ A83 ♦ J762 ♦ 84 ♣ 543 ♣ QJT</p> <p>17 ♠ A5 2 ♥ T642 12 ♦ KQ95 9 ♣ 976</p>	<p># 15 ♠ 62 S/NS ♥ QJ43 Opt. res. -140 ♦ A54 ♣ AT32</p> <p>♠ QJT93 ♠ K874 ♥ K9 ♥ 765 ♦ J2 ♦ K876 ♣ KQJ8 ♣ 74</p> <p>11 ♠ A5 13 ♥ AT82 6 ♦ QT93 10 ♣ 965</p>	<p># 16 ♠ QT86 W/EW ♥ K96 Opt. res. -110 ♦ A9 ♣ T762</p> <p>♠ K32 ♠ A954 ♥ AQJ52 ♥ 74 ♦ 84 ♦ JT73 ♣ K95 ♣ QJ4</p> <p>9 ♠ J7 13 ♥ T83 8 ♦ KQ652 10 ♣ A83</p>
<p># 17 ♠ 84 N/None ♥ Q54 Opt. res. 130 ♦ K873 ♣ Q532</p> <p>♠ QJ2 ♠ AT53 ♥ AKJ32 ♥ 9876 ♦ QJ ♦ 65 ♣ T76 ♣ A94</p> <p>7 ♠ K976 14 ♥ T 8 ♦ AT942 11 ♣ KJ8</p>	<p># 18 ♠ AJ E/NS ♥ KQ85 Opt. res. 130 ♦ AJT43 ♣ QJ</p> <p>♠ 953 ♠ T872 ♥ J64 ♥ AT92 ♦ K8 ♦ 2 ♣ 96532 ♣ AKT4</p> <p>18 ♠ KQ64 4 ♥ 73 11 ♦ Q9765 7 ♣ 87</p>		

N HPC	E HPC	S HPC	W HPC	---Voids---	---Singletons---	->=7suit-	---Balanced---
10.81	9.22	10.33	9.64	1 0 1 0	8 10 14 11	2 2 1 0	24 25 23 24

© K&G Books. C:\DP\K&G\BOOKS\HPC\HPCMAIN\HPCMAIN.HMT

<p># 19 ♠ QT95 S/EW ♥ 32 Opt. res. 110 ♦ KQJ85 ♣ AQ</p> <p>♠ 876 ♥ A9864 ♦ 96 ♣ J93</p> <p>♠ KJ43 ♥ KQ75 ♦ 32 ♣ KT8</p> <p>♠ A2 ♥ JT ♦ AT74 ♣ 76542</p> <p>14 5 12 9</p>	<p># 20 ♠ KT852 W/All ♥ 42 Opt. res. 620 ♦ KJT75 ♣ A</p> <p>♠ 3 ♥ AK6 ♦ A9832 ♣ T985</p> <p>♠ 964 ♥ JT8 ♦ Q4 ♣ QJ642</p> <p>♠ AQJ7 ♥ Q9753 ♦ 6 ♣ K73</p> <p>11 11 6 12</p>	<p># 21 ♠ AQ52 N/NS ♥ 32 Opt. res. -400 ♦ J6 ♣ J8642</p> <p>♠ T984 ♥ A ♦ AK752 ♣ A75</p> <p>♠ K6 ♥ JT85 ♦ T83 ♣ KQ93</p> <p>♠ J73 ♥ KQ9764 ♦ Q94 ♣ T</p> <p>8 15 9 8</p>	<p># 22 ♠ T9432 E/EW ♥ T Opt. res. -1100 ♦ T86 ♣ AJ72</p> <p>♠ 5 ♥ QJ53 ♦ QJ9543 ♣ K8</p> <p>♠ AQ87 ♥ AK862 ♦ A ♣ Q93</p> <p>♠ KJ6 ♥ 974 ♦ K72 ♣ T654</p> <p>5 9 19 7</p>
<p># 23 ♠ J872 S/All ♥ J93 Opt. res. 120 ♦ AT4 ♣ KQ8</p> <p>♠ QT5 ♥ QT8 ♦ KQ65 ♣ 762</p> <p>♠ A63 ♥ A72 ♦ 972 ♣ J954</p> <p>♠ K94 ♥ K654 ♦ J83 ♣ AT3</p> <p>11 9 9 11</p>	<p># 24 ♠ Q982 W/None ♥ Q3 Opt. res. 990 ♦ KJ6 ♣ AQ76</p> <p>♠ 54 ♥ T986 ♦ 98752 ♣ KT</p> <p>♠ AJ63 ♥ K42 ♦ Q43 ♣ 854</p> <p>♠ KT7 ♥ AJ75 ♦ AT ♣ J932</p> <p>14 3 10 13</p>	<p># 25 ♠ K62 N/EW ♥ J9 Opt. res. -660 ♦ AQ ♣ QJ8732</p> <p>♠ A943 ♥ 87 ♦ KJ972 ♣ A4</p> <p>♠ Q87 ♥ AKQ432 ♦ T ♣ KT9</p> <p>♠ JT5 ♥ T65 ♦ 86543 ♣ 65</p> <p>13 12 14 1</p>	<p># 26 ♠ KJ86532 E/All ♥ - Opt. res. -500 ♦ QT93 ♣ Q4</p> <p>♠ A9 ♥ KJ73 ♦ K75 ♣ JT32</p> <p>♠ 74 ♥ AQ642 ♦ A84 ♣ A65</p> <p>♠ QT ♥ T985 ♦ J62 ♣ K987</p> <p>8 12 14 6</p>
<p># 27 ♠ T542 S/None ♥ KQ2 Opt. res. -100 ♦ QJ74 ♣ Q6</p> <p>♠ AQ63 ♥ JT9654 ♦ 62 ♣ T</p> <p>♠ KJ987 ♥ 87 ♦ A3 ♣ A942</p> <p>♠ - ♥ A3 ♦ KT985 ♣ KJ8753</p> <p>10 7 12 11</p>	<p># 28 ♠ A632 W/NS ♥ Q85 Opt. res. 620 ♦ AK73 ♣ T8</p> <p>♠ KJ54 ♥ T43 ♦ Q962 ♣ A5</p> <p>♠ T98 ♥ J97 ♦ J84 ♣ J976</p> <p>♠ Q7 ♥ AK62 ♦ T5 ♣ KQ432</p> <p>13 10 3 14</p>	<p># 29 ♠ QJT75 N/All ♥ KQ4 Opt. res. -620 ♦ 8 ♣ J983</p> <p>♠ AK98 ♥ 9876 ♦ JT9 ♣ K4</p> <p>♠ 6 ♥ AJT32 ♦ A63 ♣ QT72</p> <p>♠ 432 ♥ 5 ♦ KQ7542 ♣ A65</p> <p>9 11 11 9</p>	<p># 30 ♠ Q2 E/None ♥ Q9 Opt. res. 430 ♦ KQJ974 ♣ K96</p> <p>♠ AT54 ♥ J2 ♦ AT3 ♣ QJ85</p> <p>♠ J87 ♥ KT7654 ♦ 86 ♣ 73</p> <p>♠ K963 ♥ A83 ♦ 52 ♣ AT42</p> <p>13 12 4 11</p>
<p># 31 ♠ KT65 S/NS ♥ JT5 Opt. res. 630 ♦ KQ93 ♣ T3</p> <p>♠ QJ9 ♥ A63 ♦ AT76 ♣ KQ8</p> <p>♠ 8732 ♥ 84 ♦ J54 ♣ 6542</p> <p>♠ A4 ♥ KQ972 ♦ 82 ♣ AJ97</p> <p>9 16 1 14</p>	<p># 32 ♠ Q8 W/EW ♥ Q9654 Opt. res. -110 ♦ J76 ♣ Q97</p> <p>♠ AK95 ♥ JT73 ♦ 98 ♣ AKJ</p> <p>♠ 432 ♥ A2 ♦ KQ32 ♣ T652</p> <p>♠ JT76 ♥ K8 ♦ AT54 ♣ 843</p> <p>7 16 9 8</p>	<p># 33 ♠ 98 N/None ♥ KQJ9 Opt. res. 460 ♦ Q83 ♣ QT76</p> <p>♠ T762 ♥ T86 ♦ K762 ♣ 83</p> <p>♠ A54 ♥ 7432 ♦ 94 ♣ J954</p> <p>♠ KQJ3 ♥ A5 ♦ AJT5 ♣ AK2</p> <p>10 3 5 22</p>	<p># 34 ♠ A543 E/NS ♥ J863 Opt. res. -920 ♦ 843 ♣ T6</p> <p>♠ J6 ♥ A7 ♦ KJ65 ♣ AQJ87</p> <p>♠ K872 ♥ K4 ♦ AT ♣ K9543</p> <p>♠ QT9 ♥ QT952 ♦ Q972 ♣ 2</p> <p>5 16 13 6</p>
<p># 35 ♠ QJ S/EW ♥ 8653 Opt. res. 90 ♦ AT82 ♣ J32</p> <p>♠ T8543 ♥ A4 ♦ QJ75 ♣ Q5</p> <p>♠ K2 ♥ JT972 ♦ 43 ♣ AT97</p> <p>♠ A976 ♥ KQ ♦ K96 ♣ K864</p> <p>8 9 8 15</p>	<p># 36 ♠ AK965 W/All ♥ 93 Opt. res. 110 ♦ J3 ♣ AK52</p> <p>♠ 32 ♥ QT75 ♦ KT62 ♣ QJ6</p> <p>♠ QJ4 ♥ KJ8 ♦ AQ94 ♣ 943</p> <p>♠ T87 ♥ A642 ♦ 875 ♣ T87</p> <p>15 8 13 4</p>		

N HPC	E HPC	S HPC	W HPC	---Voids---	---Singletons---	->=7suit-	---Balanced---
10.81	9.22	10.33	9.64	1 0 1 0	8 10 14 11	2 2 1 0	24 25 23 24

© K&G Books. C:\DUP\KATE\BOOKS\HPC\HPCMON180416.HPC1.AM